

**Bruce Fein and Associates, Inc**

722 12th Street, NW  
 #400  
 Washington, DC 20005

# INVOICE

**Rand Paul**

RAND PAC, Treasurer  
 P.O. Box 72598  
 502 Monroe Street  
 Newport, KY 41071  
 Newport, KY 41072

**Invoice 20017**

<b>Date</b>	Jan 27, 2014
<b>Terms</b>	On Receipt
<b>Service Thru</b>	Jan 27, 2014

**In Reference To: Paul v. Obama et al (Labor)**

<b>Date</b>	<b>By</b>	<b>Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rates</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12/26/2013	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and analysis of statutes, reports, legislative history, hearings, Federal Rules, history of NSA domestic surveillance/FISA	6.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,200.00
12/28/2013	BF	<b>Review:</b> FISA Amendments from 1978	6.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,200.00
12/30/2013	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of Judge Leon's opinion in K Layman v Obama	6.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,200.00
12/31/2013	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of ACLU complaint in ACLU v. Clapper	2.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00
12/31/2013	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of Judge Pauley's opinion in ACLU v. Clapper et al.	6.42	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,494.00
12/31/2013	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of K Layman's amended complaint in Klayman v Obama	1.95	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,365.00
01/01/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of Amended Complaint and Amicus brief in First Unitarian Church of Los Angeles v. NSA	5.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,500.00
01/02/2014	BF	<b>Meeting:</b> Meeting with James Bamford, world's expert on NSA and pioneering author on surveillance.	5.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,500.00
01/02/2014	BF	<b>Meeting:</b> Meeting with James Bamford, NSA surveillance author and expert and discussion on his amicus brief filed in support of First Unitarian Church of Los Angeles v NSA.	5.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,500.00
01/04/2014	BF	<b>Meeting:</b> Meeting with Paul Pillar, former head of CIA Counterterrorism Center	2.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00
01/06/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and Review of church Committee hearings and reports Books 2 and 3 of report.	5.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,500.00
01/07/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review Report of the President's Review Group on Intelligence and Communications Technologies for complaint	5.95	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,165.00

**Bruce Fein and Associates, Inc**

722 12th Street, NW  
 #400  
 Washington, DC 20005

# INVOICE

**Rand Paul**

RAND PAC, Treasurer  
 P.O. Box 72598  
 502 Monroe Street  
 Newport, KY 41071  
 Newport, KY 41072

**Invoice 20017**

<b>Date</b>	Jan 27, 2014
<b>Terms</b>	On Receipt
<b>Service Thru</b>	Jan 27, 2014

01/08/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review of Title III of the Omnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets Act.	1.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 700.00
01/08/2014	BF	<b>Draft:</b> Draft of initial complaint: Paul v. Obama et al.	4.87	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,409.00
01/09/2014	BF	<b>Draft:</b> Draft of initial complaint Paul v. Obama et al.	4.88	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,416.00
01/09/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and Review of material on prohibition on material support or resources to terrorists or terrorist organizations under 18 U.S.C. 2339A and 2339B and Humanitarian Law Project v. Holder.	15.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 10,500.00
01/09/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and Review 9/11 Commission report for suit	7.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,900.00
01/09/2014	ml	<b>Research:</b> New America Foundation Report: Does NSA Surveillance Stop Terrorism	3.00	\$ 110.00/hr	\$ 330.00
01/10/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review and Research of Military Commissions Act of 2006, as amended by Military Commissions Act of 2009.	3.15	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,205.00
01/10/2014	ml	<b>Research:</b> Research on NYU Law School Report on Material Assistance to Terrorist and Terrorists Organ.	3.10	\$ 110.00/hr	\$ 341.00
01/10/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Electronic Privacy Communications Act	2.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00
01/10/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> National Defense Auth. Act of 2012, section 1021.	3.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,100.00
01/11/2014	BF	<b>Draft:</b> Draft of initial complaint Paul v. Obama	7.43	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 5,201.00
01/11/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of House Select Intelligence Committee Hearing and Statements.	4.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,800.00
01/12/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of House Judiciary Committee Hearing and statements, July 31, 2013.	5.27	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,689.00
01/12/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of Senate Judiciary Committee Hearing July 17, 2013	5.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,500.00

**Bruce Fein and Associates, Inc**

722 12th Street, NW  
 #400  
 Washington, DC 20005

# INVOICE

**Rand Paul**

RAND PAC, Treasurer  
 P.O. Box 72598  
 502 Monroe Street  
 Newport, KY 41071  
 Newport, KY 41072

**Invoice 20017**

<b>Date</b>	Jan 27, 2014
<b>Terms</b>	On Receipt
<b>Service Thru</b>	Jan 27, 2014

01/14/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and Review Senate Intelligence Committee Hearing and statements, September 26, 2013.	4.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,800.00
01/15/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and review on class actions under Rule 23 of the Federal Rules of Civil Procedure.	4.97	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,479.00
01/16/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review of House Intelligence Committee Hearing and statements, October 29, 2013.	4.30	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,010.00
01/17/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> research and review of Clapper v. Amnesty International	2.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00
01/17/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review and research United States v. Knotts	3.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,100.00
01/17/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and review of Kyllo v. United States	3.02	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,114.00
01/17/2014	BF	<b>Draft:</b> Revisions of initial complaint.	3.02	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,114.00
01/17/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Remarks and press conference by the President on Review of Signals Intelligence and Fact Sheet.	3.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,100.00
01/18/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review of Veronica School District 57J v. Acton	1.07	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 749.00
01/18/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Research and review cases for suit: Skinner v. Railway Labor Exec Association, NTEU v. Von Raab	4.05	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,835.00
01/18/2014	BF	<b>Draft:</b> Revision of initial complaint review of PCVOB President's statement on oversight board.	4.08	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,856.00
01/19/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Research and Review cases: Board of Education v Earls, Camara v. Municipal Court.	2.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00
01/19/2014	BF	<b>Draft:</b> Revisions of initial complaint.	3.97	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,779.00
01/20/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review of Smith v Maryland	4.17	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,919.00
01/20/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Research and Review of U.S. v Miller and kats v. U.S.	5.27	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 3,689.00
01/21/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Research and Review of United States v. Jones	4.05	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,835.00

**Bruce Fein and Associates, Inc**

722 12th Street, NW  
 #400  
 Washington, DC 20005

# INVOICE

**Rand Paul**

RAND PAC, Treasurer  
 P.O. Box 72598  
 502 Monroe Street  
 Newport, KY 41071  
 Newport, KY 41072

**Invoice 20017**

<b>Date</b>	Jan 27, 2014
<b>Terms</b>	On Receipt
<b>Service Thru</b>	Jan 27, 2014

01/22/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review and Research cases and statutes on Report on Section 215 and the FISA Court of the President's Privacy and Civil Liberties Oversight Board.	3.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,100.00
01/22/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Thirty-six FISC orders approving the Mass Associational Tracking Program.	6.50	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,550.00
01/23/2014	BF	<b>Review:</b> Review of all Committee Hearings and Reports on FISA amendments	6.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 4,200.00
01/23/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review and Research cases and statutes on Report on Section 215 and the FISA Court of the President's Privacy and Civil Liberties Oversight Board.	2.50	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 1,750.00
01/24/2014	BF	<b>Research:</b> Review and Research cases and statutes on Report on Section 215 and the FISA Court of the President's Privacy and Civil Liberties Oversight Board.	3.00	\$ 700.00/hr	\$ 2,100.00

**Total Hours** 201.99 hrs

**Total Labor** \$ 137,794.00

**Total Invoice Amount** \$ 137,794.00

**Invoice Amount After (66.00%) Discount** \$ 46,849.96

**Previous Balance** \$ 0.00

**Balance (Amount Due)** \$ 46,849.96